
KS5 Curriculum Overview: BTEC Level 3 Health & Social Care 

 

 
 

Autumn Term Spring Term Summer Term 

Year 12 

Curriculum and Skills: 
Unit 1 - Human Lifespan Development: Physical, 
intellectual, emotional and social development 
across the human lifespan, the factors affecting 
development and the effects of ageing. 
 
Unit 2 - Working in Health and Social Care: An 
Exploration of what it is like to work in the health 
and social care sector, including the roles and 
responsibilities of workers and organisations. 
 
Unit 19 - Nutritional Health (Assessment: Internal 
assessment) Learners explore concepts of 
nutritional health and influences on dietary intake, 
and learn how to assess and improve health 
through nutrition plans for individuals. Internal 
assessment. 
 
Unit 6 - Work Experience in Health and Social Care 
(Assessment: Internal assessment) Learners explore 
the benefits of work experience. They carry out and 
reflect on a period of work experience, and plan for 
personal and professional development. 
 

Curriculum and Skills: 
Unit 2 - Working in Health and Social Care: 
continued 
 
Unit 3 - Anatomy and Physiology for Health and 
Social Care: The structure, organisation and 
function of the human body, and anatomical and 
physiological systems and medical research related 
to disorders affecting these systems. 
 
Unit 4 - Enquiries into Current Research in Health 
and Social Care (Assessment: controlled 
assessment) Learners explore the methodologies of 
contemporary research and investigate the 
implications for health and social care practice and 
services. 
 

Curriculum and Skills: 
Unit 7 - Principles of Safe Practice in Health and 
Social Care (Assessment: Internal assessment) The 
importance of safe working practices, safeguarding 
procedures and responding to emergency situations 
in health and social care settings. 

Assessment: 
Unit 1 Assessment: 1.5 hour written examination 
 
Unit 6 - Internal assessment 
 
 
 
 

Assessment: 
Unit 4 - Assessment: controlled assessment 

Assessment: 
Unit 2 - Assessment: 1.5 hour written examination 
 
Unit 3 - Assessment: 1.5 hour written examination 



 

 

Year 13 

Curriculum and Skills: 
 
Unit 5 - Meeting Individual Care and Support Needs 
(Assessment: Internal assessment) Focusing on the 
principles and practicalities that underpin meeting 
individuals’ care and support needs, which are the 
foundation of all the care disciplines. 
 
Unit 7 - Principles of Safe Practice in Health and 
Social Care (Assessment: Internal assessment) The 
importance of safe working practices, safeguarding 
procedures and responding to emergency situations 
in health and social care settings. 
 
Unit 8 - Promoting Public Health (Assessment: 
Internal assessment) Learners explore the aims of 
public health policy and the current approaches to 
promoting and protecting health and encouraging 
behaviour change in the population. 
 

 

Curriculum and Skills: 
 
Unit 11 - Psychological Perspectives (Assessment: 
Internal assessment) Learners explore key 
theoretical perspectives that have been put 
forward on psychological and physical development 
and how they are applied in different health and 
social care settings. 
 
Unit 12 - Supporting Individuals with Additional 
Needs (Assessment: Internal assessment) The role 
of health and social care services in providing care 
and support to individuals with additional needs. 
 
Unit 17 - Caring for Individuals with Dementia 
(Assessment: Internal assessment) Learners explore 
conditions leading to dementia, their causes, 
symptoms, the effects on individuals and the 
support required to ensure independence and 
dignity for individuals. 

Curriculum and Skills: 
 
Unit 18 - Assessing Children’s Development Support 
Needs (Assessment: Internal assessment) Theories 
that explain how children develop, the factors that 
may affect development, and how growth and 
development is monitored and supported. Internal 
assessment 
 

Assessment: 
Unit 5 Assessment: Internal assessment – Part 1 
 
Unit 7 - Assessment: Internal assessment – Part 1 
 
Unit 8 - Assessment: Internal assessment – Part 1 
 
 

 
 
 
 

Assessment: 
Unit 5 Assessment: Internal assessment – Part 1 
 
Unit 7 - Assessment: Internal assessment – Part 1 
 
Unit 8 - Assessment: Internal assessment – Part 1 
 
Unit 11 - Assessment: Internal assessment 
 
Unit 12 - Assessment: Internal assessment 
 

Assessment:  
Unit 17 - Assessment: Internal assessment 
 
Unit 18 Assessment: Internal assessment 


